
WYOMING  SILHOUETTE RIFLE CHAMPIONSHIPS 

LANDER VALLEY SPORTSMEN      JUNE 27-28, 2020 

Very pleasant weather gave shooters an enjoyable event until mid-Sunday's gusts 
and sprinkle came thru.  The buck pronghorn was entertained by watching Cross 
topple SB pigs, then wandered out past the rams when the target setters headed 
out.  Morning temps were mid-50's but soon warmed to the 80's.  Minor 
excitement was generated with a rattle snake in the stat office.  A little persuasion 
was needed to control that and it was moved outdoors again. 

Scott Larson, Pierre, SD was the 4 gun winner scoring 223/320.  Only 3 points 
behind was Chris Farwell, Littleton, CO.  Larson uses an Anschutz 54.18 w/ 30X 
Leupold, Rem 700 in 250 Savage w/ 8.5-25X Leupold, Anschutz 1710 W/ 8.5-25X 
Leupold and Rem 700 in 6BR w/ 6.5-20 Leupold. 

The 2 day event features a 2 x 40 format with each rifle division shooting standard 
rifles on Saturday and then hunting rifles on Sunday.  Due to the CORID 19 virus 
attendance was a little lower than past years but the sportsmanship and 
willingness to help when asked made the event run very smooth.  Twelve shot SB 
and 10 HP each day. 

SMALLBORE  WY CHAMPION is Scott Larson with 62. 

1st Master Chris Farwell @ 57.     1st AAA goes to Clint Habeck, Ft.Pierre, SD @ 58 
with 2nd AAA @ 53 by Scott Dahms, Littleton, CO.  Winning 1st AA & Hi-Sr was 
Tony Cross, Lander @ 55.  Surprisingly only two 10's were recorded along with 13 
five in a row's.  

HIGH POWER WY CHAMPIONS is Scott Larson @ 52. 

In AAA Chris Farwell was 1st @ 50 and 2nd went to Kevin Erickson, Corvallis, MT 
@ 41.  Clint Habeck earned 1st AA @ 50. Roger Sebesta's 37 was top A.  Cross was 
Hi-SR @ 43.  No 10's fired, 8 had 5 in a row recorded. 

SMALLBORE HUNTING WY CHAMPION is Chris Farwell with 68. 

1st Master @58 is Scott Larson with Habeck's 55 as 2nd M.  Cross earned 1st AAA 
@ 57 while 2nd went to Erickson's 53. Tom Kallemeyen, Pierre, SD put 52 into the 



dirt for the AA win.  Cross picked up Hi-SR. Three fired 10's & 19 5 in a row were 
shot. 

HI POWER HUNTING WY CHAMPION is Clint Habeck with 52. 

Earning 1st AAA with 51 is Larson with 2nd going to Farwell's 45.  Taking the AA 
win @ 46 is Mark Sorensen, Deadwood, SD.  Sebesta tallied 24 in A. Ronald Kamp, 
Daniel, WY is Hi-SR.  No 10's , but 6 posted 5's. 

A BIG THANK YOU goes to the door prize donors:  Wind River Outdoors, Ron 
Kamp Wood Works, Lander Valley Sportsmen, Wilderness Medicine/Melessa 
Gray, Guns and Goods/Sebesta.  Four wheelers were loaned by Scott 
Hemmingway, Ron Reemts, John Nolan and Danny Greenamyer.  Saturday 
evening the elk brat’s meal was outstanding by Cross & Gray.  Mark Crawford 
compiled stats on his lap top and eliminated errors in addition on the scoreboard.  
The target setters earned over $100 each by hustling; thank you- Micaiah & 
Benaiah Dolence,  Josh & Jacob Greenamyer.  They needed only 3 -4 minutes to 
reset SB or HP.  Great work!    

We pray your trip home went well.  Until we get to shoot together again, Best 
wishes   Roger and Tony, Lander Valley Sportsmen 

 


